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Reporting Date
Cash Bids May 5, 2021 Harvest Bids
Upper Eastern Shore Upper Eastern Shore

Low i Average Harvest Low High Average
$7.20 K $7.30 Corn No. 2 21-Dec $5.80 $5.91 $5.85
$6.48 . $6.53 Wheat No. 2 21-Jul $6.57 $6.80 $6.68
No Bid i No Bid Barley No. 2 21-Jul No Bid No Bid No Bid
$14.97 . $15.11 Soybeans No.2 21-Nov  $12.88 $13.80 $13.18

Mid Eastern Shore Mid Eastern Shore
Low i Average Harvest Low High Average
$7.21 K $7.39 Corn No. 2 21-Dec $5.86 $6.01 $5.94
$6.48 . $6.53 Wheat No. 2 21-Jul $6.57 $6.67 $6.60
No Bid i No Bid Barley No. 2 21-Jul No Bid No Bid No Bid
$14.97 . $15.12 Soybeans No.2 21-Nov  $12.88 $13.08 $13.00

Lower Eastern Shore
Low i Average Harvest Low High Average
$7.62 K $7.62 Corn No. 2 21-Dec $5.81 $6.01 $5.95
$6.57 . $6.57 Wheat No. 2 21-Jul $6.37 $6.67 $6.54
No Bid i No Bid Barley No. 2 21-Jul No Bid No Bid No Bid
$15.18 . $15.18 Soybeans No.2 21-Nov  $12.98 $13.18 $13.04

Central Md
Average Harvest Low i Average
$7.50 Corn No. 2 21-Dec No Bid i No Bid
No Bid Wheat No. 2 21-Jul $6.72 . $6.72
No Bid Barley No. 2 21-Jul No Bid i No Bid
No Bid Soybeans No.2 21-Nov  $13.03 . $13.03

Western Md
Low High Average Harvest Low i Average
$6.90 $7.50 $7.37 Corn No. 2 21-Dec $6.15 . $6.15
$6.95 $7.60 $7.28 Wheat No. 2 21-Jul $7.35 . $7.35
$3.75 $4.70 $4.25 Barley No. 2 21-Jul $3.75 . $3.75
$14.50 $15.05 $14.85 Soybeans No.2 21-Nov  $13.10 . $13.10

Today's Today's Today's Last Week Compared to Avg Last Avg Last
Low High  Average Average Last Week Month Year
$6.90 $7.62 $7.39 $7.08 $0.32 $5.97 $3.53
$7.42 $7.60 $6.63 $6.90 ($0.27) $5.63 $5.38
Barley No. 3 $3.75 $4.70 $4.25 $4.18 $0.07 $4.02 $3.22
Soybeans No. 2 $14.50 $15.29 $15.08 $15.25 ($0.17) $13.72 $7.94

Wheat Soybeans

$6.63 $6.90
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